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There are approximately 370 mil-
lion Indigenous people spread 
across 70 countries worldwide (UN, 
2009). They represent as many as 
5000 different cultures and account 
for much of the world’s cultural diver-
sity (UN, 2009). Indigenous people 
live in a wide variety of environments 
and circumstances (UN, 2009). De-
spite this diversity, many Indigenous 
people around the world, in both 
high-income countries and low- and 
middle-income countries, continue 
to face substantial economic, health, 
and social disadvantages as a result 
of an enduring legacy of colonization, 
an ongoing marginalization and dis-
empowerment, and the social, struc-
tural, and political arrangements of 
the countries in which they live (UN, 
2009; Paradies, 2016).

Gaining an accurate statistical 
picture of the health and well-being 
of Indigenous populations is chal-
lenging. In some countries, the na-
tional information infrastructure is 
inadequate for the whole population; 
in others, high-quality data exist for 

the total population, but Indigenous 
people are not always identified as 
such in the relevant data collections. 
In addition, some Indigenous popu-
lations live on lands that cross mod-
ern-day national boundaries (e.g. the 
Sami in northern Europe), and many 
countries group together several dis-
tinct Indigenous populations using a 
single umbrella term (e.g. Aboriginal 
in Australia, First Nations in Canada, 
and Native American in the USA).

Despite the data limitations aris-
ing from such challenges, it is in-
creasingly clear that cancer is an im-
portant health priority for Indigenous 
populations throughout the world 
both in absolute terms, as a leading 
cause of illness and death, and in 
relative terms, based on disparities 
in the cancer burden between Indig-
enous and non-Indigenous popula-
tions within countries. Furthermore, 
in an era of major advances in re-
ducing the impact of cancer, there 
is evidence that disparities between 
Indigenous and non-Indigenous pop-
ulations may be widening (Fig. F5.1).

Studies from around the world 
provide evidence that Indigenous 
populations experience signifi-
cant disparities relative to the local 
non-Indigenous populations with 
respect to risk factor prevalence, 
cancer incidence, stage at diag-
nosis, care received, and disease 
outcomes (Moore et al., 2015; El-
lison-Loschmann et al., 2017). Al-
though variation exists between and 
within countries, Indigenous people 
are more likely to have cancers that 
are largely preventable, detectable 
by screening, and/or have a poor 
prognosis, such as lung, liver, and 
cervical cancers (Moore et al., 2015).

To date, published reports on 
cancer in Indigenous populations 
have come largely from Austra-
lia, Canada, New Zealand, and the 
USA; even in these countries, how-
ever, limitations in data quality and 
availability have generally precluded 
national-level reporting (with the ex-
ception of New Zealand) (Boyd et al., 
2016). Data inadequacies have also 
limited the number of cross-country 
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comparisons. Moore et al. (2015) 
reported higher incidence rates of 
preventable cancers for a range 
of Indigenous populations across 
Australia, Canada, New Zealand, 
and the USA, with some notable 
variations among groups (Moore 
et al., 2015). Systematic reviews of 
peer-reviewed literature have been 
used in some countries to overcome 
data inadequacies (Hassler et al., 
2008; Moore et al., 2014). Moore 
et al. (2014) found higher incidence 
rates of cervical cancer in parts of 
Brazil, Ecuador, and Guyana for 
Indigenous women compared with 
non-Indigenous women; higher in-
cidence rates of stomach cancer in 
regions of Chile and of gallbladder 
cancer in Bolivia and Chile were also 
reported for Indigenous populations 
compared with non-Indigenous pop-
ulations (Moore et al., 2014). Within 
countries, data linkage has been 
used to overcome deficiencies in 
population-level cancer surveillance 
programmes to enable reporting for 

Indigenous populations, for example 
in Australia (Whop et al., 2016), Can-
ada (Sanchez-Ramirez et al., 2016), 
and the USA (Espey et al., 2008).

A broad range of factors may 
contribute to poorer cancer out-
comes for Indigenous populations, 
including those relating to individual 
patients, health-care systems, and 
sociocultural and political contexts 
(Fig. F5.2). Although many of these 
interconnected and multifaceted 
factors are relevant for Indigenous 
populations globally, the relative 
importance of particular factors is 
likely to vary from place to place. 
In addition to the Indigenous-spe-
cific factors included in Fig.  F5.2, 
patterns of cancer incidence and 
mortality in Indigenous populations 
are also strongly influenced by the 
prevalence of traditional risk factors 
such as tobacco use, excessive al-
cohol consumption, nutrition, and 
level of physical activity, as well 
as by social determinants such as 
education level, employment, in-

come, and housing (more informa-
tion about the social determinants 
of cancer is provided in Chapters 3 
and 7).

Key international bodies, includ-
ing the Seventieth World Health 
Assembly and the Union for Inter-
national Cancer Control, have rec-
ognized the need for specific, tar-
geted cancer control strategies for 
population groups experiencing an 
inequitable cancer burden. Under-
standings of health and well-being 
are culturally bound (Petersen et al., 
2004), and this needs to be consid-
ered in improving the performance 
of the cancer system with and for 
Indigenous people. For example, 
Cancer Care Ontario’s Aboriginal 
Cancer Strategy aims to do this 
by honouring the Aboriginal Path 
of Well-being (Fig.  F5.3) (Keway-
osh et al., 2015). The development 
of shared principles and priorities 
to guide efforts to improve cancer 
outcomes for Indigenous popula-
tions is also critical. For example, 

Fig. F5.1. Trends in age-standardized mortality rates of all cancers combined, by Australian Indigenous status, 1998–
2015. Source: compiled from Australian Institute of Health and Welfare (2018). Cancer in Aboriginal and Torres Strait 
Islander people of Australia. Cat. no.: CAN 109. Canberra, Australia: AIHW. https://www.aihw.gov.au/reports/cancer-
screening/cancer-in-Indigenous-australians/contents/mortality.
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Cancer Australia, the Australian  
government’s key cancer control 
agency, undertook extensive stake-
holder consultation with a wide 
range of key Indigenous organiza-
tions and individuals, as well as with 
health service providers, govern-
ments, nongovernmental organiza-
tions, and researchers, to develop 
the National Aboriginal and Torres 
Strait Islander Cancer Framework 
(Cancer Australia, 2015). This 
framework is underpinned by four 
key principles: Indigenous engage-
ment, Indigenous information and 
empowerment, working together, 
and evidence-informed practice. 
The key priorities address issues 
such as cancer-related health liter-
acy, prevention and early detection, 
optimal treatment, supportive care, 
and service development, with a 
range of enablers highlighted (Can-
cer Australia, 2015).

Fig. F5.2. Factors affecting cancer outcomes of Indigenous people. Design by Lea Bill and Alana Gall.

Fig. F5.3. An example of incorporating Indigenous understandings of health 
and well-being into a jurisdictional cancer strategy: Cancer Ontario’s Aborig-
inal Cancer Strategy II. Source: reproduced with permission from Kewayosh 
et al. (2015).
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Addressing the excess cancer 
burden for Indigenous populations 
requires culturally appropriate public 
health interventions that are devel-
oped, implemented, and evaluated 
in partnership with Indigenous com-
munities. Such community partner-
ships can have a positive impact in 
addressing cancer disparities provid-
ing they are built on trust, a shared 
commitment, agreement of the out-
comes, and mutual benefit, and that 
Indigenous people are involved at all 
levels. An example of a successful 
collaborative partnership is the can-
cer prevention and screening prac-
tices project among Alberta First 
Nations communities (Voyageur et 
al., 2018). Providing patient navi-
gators and conducting community 
education workshops can also play 
an important role in improving can-
cer screening rates and empowering 

Indigenous populations (Burhanssti-
panov et al., 2017).

Conclusions

Measuring the cancer burden of In-
digenous populations is critically 
important, but gaps and challenges 
remain. In particular, reliable and 
accurate data are needed to devel-
op appropriate cancer policy, priority 
setting, and service responses, and 
to monitor cancer outcomes over 
time. In addition to measuring tradi-
tional end-points such as morbidi-
ty and mortality, better information 
is also needed about quality of life, 
well-being, and the psychosocial 
impacts of cancer for Indigenous 
people. Sarfati et al. (2018) have de-
scribed key issues relating to cancer 
surveillance among Indigenous pop-
ulations and suggested a range of 

solutions to strengthen their visibility. 
In particular, it is critical to ensure 
that Indigenous people are centrally 
involved in determining appropriate 
data governance structures, includ-
ing data ownership and access.

Improved measurement is nec-
essary but by no means sufficient 
to reduce the cancer burden for In-
digenous populations. Indigenous 
leadership, empowering Indigenous 
communities, and establishing au-
thentic partnerships across the con-
tinuum of cancer care are vital to 
eliminating cancer inequalities. The 
development of a culturally compe-
tent health-care workforce and of 
culturally appropriate systems, ser-
vices, and programmes is also need-
ed. Research is required to identify 
and evaluate innovative approaches 
to cancer control across the cancer 
continuum.
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